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Reference: FOI 43488 FRIM D4U1Y   
 
Subject:  ADHD Services 
 
I can confirm that we have now completed the search for the information requested, please see responses below: 
 
NHS Frimley Integrated Care Board (ICB) was formed on 1 July 2022 under the Health and Social Care Act 2022, replacing NHS Frimley Clinical Commissioning Group (CCG).  NHS 
Frimley is made up of five Places: (1) Bracknell Forest, (2) Royal Borough of Windsor and Maidenhead, (3) Slough, (4) North East Hampshire and Farnham and (5) Surrey Heath.  
 
Please note that the legacy organisation NHS Frimley CCG existed between 1 April 2021 and 30 June 2022.  NHS Frimley CCG was formed from the earlier merger of three legacy 
organisations – NHS East Berkshire CCG: NHS North East Hampshire and Farnham CCG and NHS Surrey Heath CCG. 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

QUESTIONS FOCUSED ON ADULT ADHD SERVICES 

1. For your financial years 2022-23 and 2021-22 please can you tell us: 

a. For each of those years how many adult assessments for ADHD were 
done? 

i. If you have the data and it won't take us over the costs limit 
please can you break this down by gender. 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Surrey and Borders 
Partnership NHS Trust, as they may be able to provide the data requested. 

b. For each of those years what was the average waiting time (in weeks) 
for adults who had an assessment for ADHD (Attention Deficit 
Hyperactivity Disorder). 

i. If you have the data and it won't take us over the costs limit 
please can you break this down by gender. 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Surrey and Borders 
Partnership NHS Trust, as they may be able to provide the data requested. 

https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
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c. For each of those years how many adult ADHD referrals were rejected 
prior to the individual receiving an assessment? 

i. If you have the data and it won't take us over the costs limit 
please can you break this down by gender. 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Surrey and Borders 
Partnership NHS Trust, as they may be able to provide the data requested. 

d. For each of those years how many adults were waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment at the end of the year. 

i. If you have the data and it won't take us over the costs limit 
please can you break this down by gender. 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Surrey and Borders 
Partnership NHS Trust, as they may be able to provide the data requested. 

QUESTIONS FOCUSED ON CHILD ADHD SERVICES 

2. For your financial years 2022-23 and 2021-22 please can you tell us: 

a. For each of those years how many child assessments for ADHD 
(Attention Deficit Hyperactivity Disorder) were done? 

i. If you have the data and it won't take us over the costs limit 
please can you break this down by gender. 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Surrey and Borders 
Partnership NHS Trust, as they may be able to provide the data requested. 

b. For each of those years what was the average waiting time (in weeks) 
for children who had an assessment for ADHD (Attention Deficit 
Hyperactivity Disorder). 

i. If you have the data and it won't take us over the costs limit 
please can you break this down by gender. 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Surrey and Borders 
Partnership NHS Trust, as they may be able to provide the data requested. 

c. For each of those years how many child ADHD referrals were rejected 
prior to assessment? 

i. If you have the data and it won't take us over the costs limit 
please can you break this down by gender. 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Surrey and Borders 
Partnership NHS Trust, as they may be able to provide the data requested. 

https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
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d. For each of those years how many children were waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment at the end of the year. 

i. If you have the data and it won't take us over the costs limit 
please can you break this down by gender. 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Surrey and Borders 
Partnership NHS Trust, as they may be able to provide the data requested. 

GENERAL QUESTIONS ABOUT YOUR ORGANISATION AND ITS ADHD SERVICES 

3. With relation to the present time (reflecting the most recent data that you have). Please can you answer the following questions: 
a. With regards to your adult ADHD services. 

i. Do you currently have a commissioned adult ADHD 
assessment service?. We commission Surrey and Borders Partnership NHS Trust 

ii. How many adults do you have waiting for an adult ADHD 
assessment? 
 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Surrey and Borders 
Partnership NHS Trust, as they may be able to provide the data requested. 

iii. What is your current expected waiting time (in weeks) for an 
adult ADHD Assessment? 
 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Surrey and Borders 
Partnership NHS Trust, as they may be able to provide the data requested. 

iv. What is your current longest waiting time for an adult ADHD 
Assessment? 
 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Surrey and Borders 
Partnership NHS Trust, as they may be able to provide the data requested. 

https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
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v. What is your process for reviewing and deciding whether to 
accept or reject adults who have been referred for an ADHD 
assessment 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Surrey and Borders 
Partnership NHS Trust, as they may be able to provide the data requested. 

vi. Is your organisation confident that it is satisfying the NICE 
guidelines for adults with ADHD? 
 

The NICE guidelines are aimed at providers of ADHD services rather than 
commissioners 

b. With regards to your child ADHD services: 

i. Do you currently have a commissioned child ADHD 
Assessment service? 
 

Psicon and Berkshire Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust both deliver CYP ADHD 
assessments in our ICB area. For Surrey Heath and Farnham please contact Surrey 
Heartlands ICB 

ii. How many children do you have waiting for a child ADHD 
assessment? 
 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Berkshire Healthcare NHS 
Foundation Trust and Surrey Heartlands ICB, as they may be able to provide the 
data requested. 

iii. What is your current expected waiting time (in weeks) for a 
child ADHD Assessment? 
 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Berkshire Healthcare NHS 
Foundation Trust and Surrey Heartlands ICB, as they may be able to provide the 
data requested. 

iv. What is your current longest waiting time for a child ADHD 
Assessment? 
 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Berkshire Healthcare NHS 
Foundation Trust and Surrey Heartlands ICB, as they may be able to provide the 
data requested. 

https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.sabp.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-info
https://www.berkshirehealthcare.nhs.uk/contact-us/get-in-touch/freedom-of-information-request/
https://www.surreyheartlands.org/freedom-of-information
https://www.surreyheartlands.org/freedom-of-information
https://www.berkshirehealthcare.nhs.uk/contact-us/get-in-touch/freedom-of-information-request/
https://www.berkshirehealthcare.nhs.uk/contact-us/get-in-touch/freedom-of-information-request/
https://www.surreyheartlands.org/freedom-of-information
https://www.berkshirehealthcare.nhs.uk/contact-us/get-in-touch/freedom-of-information-request/
https://www.berkshirehealthcare.nhs.uk/contact-us/get-in-touch/freedom-of-information-request/
https://www.surreyheartlands.org/freedom-of-information
https://www.berkshirehealthcare.nhs.uk/contact-us/get-in-touch/freedom-of-information-request/
https://www.berkshirehealthcare.nhs.uk/contact-us/get-in-touch/freedom-of-information-request/
https://www.surreyheartlands.org/freedom-of-information
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v. What is your process for reviewing and deciding whether to 
accept or reject children who have been referred for an ADHD 
assessment. 
 

This information is not held by the ICB.  Please contact Berkshire Healthcare NHS 
Foundation Trust and Surrey Heartlands ICB, as they may be able to provide the 
data requested. 

vi. Is your organisation confident that it is satisfying the NICE 
guidelines for children with ADHD? 
 

The NICE guidelines are aimed at providers of ADHD services rather than 
commissioners 

c. Information on your financial year. 

i. What are the dates of your financial year 2022-23. 
 1st April 2022 to 31st March 2023 

ii. What are the dates of your financial year 2021-22. 1st April 2021 to 31st March 2022 

 
 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 19 May 2023 and has been authorised for release by NHS Frimley ICB. 

https://www.berkshirehealthcare.nhs.uk/contact-us/get-in-touch/freedom-of-information-request/
https://www.berkshirehealthcare.nhs.uk/contact-us/get-in-touch/freedom-of-information-request/
https://www.surreyheartlands.org/freedom-of-information

