
    
 

 
 
 
 
 

 

 
 
Our Ref :  FOI 2023-024 
 
Date:   11 May 2023 
 
  
 
Dear Enquirer 
 
Re: Freedom of Information Request  
 
Thank you for your recent request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
received on 17 April 2023.  
 
NHS Barnsley, Doncaster, Rotherham and Sheffield CCGs were statutory organisations 
between 1 April 2013 and 30 June 2022.  From 1 July 2022 all statutory duties have been 
transitioned into the NHS South Yorkshire Integrated Care Board (ICB).    
 
Please see below your original questions, followed with our responses in the table below. 
 

Q1 QUESTIONS FOCUSED ON ADULT ADHD SERVICES 
For your financial years 2022-23 and 2021-22 please can you tell us:  

a. For each of those years how many adult assessments for ADHD were 
done?  

• If you have the data and it won’t take us over the costs limit please 
can you break this down by gender. 

b. For each of those years what was the average waiting time (in weeks) 
for adults who had an assessment for ADHD (Attention Deficit 
Hyperactivity Disorder).  

• If you have the data and it won’t take us over the costs limit please 
can you break this down by gender. 

c. For each of those years how many adult ADHD referrals were rejected 
prior to the individual receiving an assessment?  

• If you have the data and it won’t take us over the costs limit please 
can you break this down by gender. 
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d. For each of those years how many adults were waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment at the end of the year.  

• If you have the data and it won’t take us over the costs limit please 
can you break this down by gender. 
 

Response 1 We do not hold this information.   Please contact the service providers for 
Adult ADHD services 
 

Rotherham Doncaster and South Humber NHS Foundation Trust (RDaSH): 
https://www.rdash.nhs.uk/support-and-advice/information-
governance/freedom-of-information 
 
Sheffield Health and Social Care NHS Foundation Trust: 
https://www.shsc.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-information-requests 
 
South West Yorkshire Partnership NHS Foundation Trust 
(SWYPFT)  https://www.southwestyorkshire.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-of-
information/how-to-make-a-request 
 

Q2 QUESTIONS FOCUSED ON CHILD ADHD SERVICES   
For your financial years 2022-23 and 2021-22 please can you tell us:  

a. For each of those years how many child assessments for ADHD 
(Attention Deficit Hyperactivity Disorder) were done?  

• If you have the data and it won’t take us over the costs limit please 
can you break this down by gender. 

b. For each of those years what was the average waiting time (in weeks) 
for children who had an assessment for ADHD (Attention Deficit 
Hyperactivity Disorder).  

• If you have the data and it won’t take us over the costs limit please 
can you break this down by gender. 

c. For each of those years how many child ADHD referrals were rejected 
prior to assessment?  

• If you have the data and it won’t take us over the costs limit please 
can you break this down by gender. 

d. For each of those years how many children were waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment at the end of the year.  

• If you have the data and it won’t take us over the costs limit please 
can you break this down by gender. 
 

Response 2 We do not hold this information.  Please contact the service provider for 
Children’s ADHD services,  
 
Rotherham Doncaster and South Humber NHS Foundation Trust (RDaSH): 
https://www.rdash.nhs.uk/support-and-advice/information-
governance/freedom-of-information. 

https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.rdash.nhs.uk%2Fsupport-and-advice%2Finformation-governance%2Ffreedom-of-information%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cdb27a2d912bf42fc474408db40e16179%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638175108963543912%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=18%2BA5T8rzmL%2F4DMeO6MDqKO9q93Nd2rY%2Fn7a5Ww0wiE%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.rdash.nhs.uk%2Fsupport-and-advice%2Finformation-governance%2Ffreedom-of-information%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cdb27a2d912bf42fc474408db40e16179%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638175108963543912%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=18%2BA5T8rzmL%2F4DMeO6MDqKO9q93Nd2rY%2Fn7a5Ww0wiE%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.shsc.nhs.uk%2Fcontact-us%2Ffreedom-information-requests&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cb76d3ecaf51341ac345808db47bf7a6f%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638182659934686511%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=Gtnv8%2FPVMzlM1KvK9XLlXvSE5On1GWN%2Fw0GoD0ROc7Y%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.southwestyorkshire.nhs.uk%2Fcontact-us%2Ffreedom-of-information%2Fhow-to-make-a-request%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cc5dd4276a51d4287220808db40182cbf%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638174244786343363%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=wbK94K1dh6WPAPq4bxoFv8Pq9m10kq8NM4txrAblk1Y%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.southwestyorkshire.nhs.uk%2Fcontact-us%2Ffreedom-of-information%2Fhow-to-make-a-request%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cc5dd4276a51d4287220808db40182cbf%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638174244786343363%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=wbK94K1dh6WPAPq4bxoFv8Pq9m10kq8NM4txrAblk1Y%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.rdash.nhs.uk%2Fsupport-and-advice%2Finformation-governance%2Ffreedom-of-information%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cdb27a2d912bf42fc474408db40e16179%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638175108963543912%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=18%2BA5T8rzmL%2F4DMeO6MDqKO9q93Nd2rY%2Fn7a5Ww0wiE%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.rdash.nhs.uk%2Fsupport-and-advice%2Finformation-governance%2Ffreedom-of-information%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cdb27a2d912bf42fc474408db40e16179%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638175108963543912%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=18%2BA5T8rzmL%2F4DMeO6MDqKO9q93Nd2rY%2Fn7a5Ww0wiE%3D&reserved=0


 
 

 
Sheffield Children’s NHS Foundation Trust: 
https://www.sheffieldchildrens.nhs.uk/about-us/publications/freedom-of-
information/ 
 
South West Yorkshire Partnership NHS Foundation Trust 
(SWYPFT)  https://www.southwestyorkshire.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-of-
information/how-to-make-a-request 
 

Q3 GENERAL QUESTIONS ABOUT YOUR ORGANISATION AND ITS 
ADHD SERVICES   
With relation to the present time (reflecting the most recent data that you 
have). Please can you answer the following questions:  
 
A. With regards to your adult ADHD services.  

• Do you currently have a commissioned adult ADHD assessment 
service? 

• How many adults do you have waiting for an adult ADHD 
assessment? 

• What is your current expected waiting time (in weeks) for an adult 
ADHD Assessment? 

• What is your current longest waiting time for an adult ADHD 
Assessment? 

• What is your process for reviewing and deciding whether to accept 
or reject adults who have been referred for an ADHD assessment. 

• Is your organisation confident that it is satisfying the NICE guidelines 
for adults with ADHD? 

b. With regards to your child ADHD services  

• Do you currently have a commissioned child ADHD Assessment 
service? 

• How many children do you have waiting for a child ADHD 
assessment? 

• What is your current expected waiting time (in weeks) for a child 
ADHD Assessment? 

• What is your current longest waiting time for a child ADHD 
Assessment? 

• What is your process for reviewing and deciding whether to accept 
or reject children who have been referred for an ADHD assessment. 

• Is your organisation confident that it is satisfying the NICE guidelines 
for children with ADHD? 

c. Information on your financial year.  

• What are the dates of your financial year 2022-23. 

• What are the dates of your financial year 2021-22. 
 

Response 3 South Yorkshrie ICB commissions both adults and children’s services.   For 
all the other information requested please contact the Service Providers as 
follows:- 
  

https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.sheffieldchildrens.nhs.uk%2Fabout-us%2Fpublications%2Ffreedom-of-information%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cb76d3ecaf51341ac345808db47bf7a6f%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638182659934842758%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=XE1GY8F%2F8Wv33Ttfdy7ehMqrD1RLIeG4JIFALnd6ulE%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.sheffieldchildrens.nhs.uk%2Fabout-us%2Fpublications%2Ffreedom-of-information%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cb76d3ecaf51341ac345808db47bf7a6f%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638182659934842758%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=XE1GY8F%2F8Wv33Ttfdy7ehMqrD1RLIeG4JIFALnd6ulE%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.southwestyorkshire.nhs.uk%2Fcontact-us%2Ffreedom-of-information%2Fhow-to-make-a-request%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cc5dd4276a51d4287220808db40182cbf%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638174244786343363%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=wbK94K1dh6WPAPq4bxoFv8Pq9m10kq8NM4txrAblk1Y%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.southwestyorkshire.nhs.uk%2Fcontact-us%2Ffreedom-of-information%2Fhow-to-make-a-request%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cc5dd4276a51d4287220808db40182cbf%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638174244786343363%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=wbK94K1dh6WPAPq4bxoFv8Pq9m10kq8NM4txrAblk1Y%3D&reserved=0


 
 

Rotherham Doncaster and South Humber NHS Foundation Trust (RDaSH): 
https://www.rdash.nhs.uk/support-and-advice/information-
governance/freedom-of-information 
 
Sheffield Children’s NHS Foundation Trust: 
https://www.sheffieldchildrens.nhs.uk/about-us/publications/freedom-of-
information/ 
 
Sheffield Health and Social Care NHS Foundation Trust: 
https://www.shsc.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-information-requests 
 
South West Yorkshire Partnership NHS Foundation Trust 
(SWYPFT)  https://www.southwestyorkshire.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-of-
information/how-to-make-a-request 
 

 
 
If you are dissatisfied with this response or wish for an internal review, please write to our 
Director of Corporate Governance at syicb-sheffield.icbcomplaints@nhs.net.  It would be 
helpful if you could quote our reference number in any communications. 
 
If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, with regards to this Freedom of 
Information request, you have the right to appeal to the Information Commissioner.  The 
Information Commissioner will not investigate your case unless you have exhausted our 
complaints procedure. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at: The Information 
Commissioners Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF. 
 
Yours sincerely  
 
ICB FOI Coordinator  
 

https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.rdash.nhs.uk%2Fsupport-and-advice%2Finformation-governance%2Ffreedom-of-information%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cdb27a2d912bf42fc474408db40e16179%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638175108963543912%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=18%2BA5T8rzmL%2F4DMeO6MDqKO9q93Nd2rY%2Fn7a5Ww0wiE%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.rdash.nhs.uk%2Fsupport-and-advice%2Finformation-governance%2Ffreedom-of-information%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cdb27a2d912bf42fc474408db40e16179%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638175108963543912%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=18%2BA5T8rzmL%2F4DMeO6MDqKO9q93Nd2rY%2Fn7a5Ww0wiE%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.sheffieldchildrens.nhs.uk%2Fabout-us%2Fpublications%2Ffreedom-of-information%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cb76d3ecaf51341ac345808db47bf7a6f%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638182659934842758%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=XE1GY8F%2F8Wv33Ttfdy7ehMqrD1RLIeG4JIFALnd6ulE%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.sheffieldchildrens.nhs.uk%2Fabout-us%2Fpublications%2Ffreedom-of-information%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cb76d3ecaf51341ac345808db47bf7a6f%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638182659934842758%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=XE1GY8F%2F8Wv33Ttfdy7ehMqrD1RLIeG4JIFALnd6ulE%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.shsc.nhs.uk%2Fcontact-us%2Ffreedom-information-requests&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cb76d3ecaf51341ac345808db47bf7a6f%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638182659934686511%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=Gtnv8%2FPVMzlM1KvK9XLlXvSE5On1GWN%2Fw0GoD0ROc7Y%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.southwestyorkshire.nhs.uk%2Fcontact-us%2Ffreedom-of-information%2Fhow-to-make-a-request%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cc5dd4276a51d4287220808db40182cbf%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638174244786343363%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=wbK94K1dh6WPAPq4bxoFv8Pq9m10kq8NM4txrAblk1Y%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.southwestyorkshire.nhs.uk%2Fcontact-us%2Ffreedom-of-information%2Fhow-to-make-a-request%2F&data=05%7C01%7Csyicb-sheffield.freedomofinformation%40nhs.net%7Cc5dd4276a51d4287220808db40182cbf%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638174244786343363%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=wbK94K1dh6WPAPq4bxoFv8Pq9m10kq8NM4txrAblk1Y%3D&reserved=0
mailto:syicb-sheffield.icbcomplaints@nhs.net

