
 

  

 

 Freedom of Information 
Information Governance 

Woodfield House, Trust Headquarters 
    Tickhill Road Site, Weston Road, Balby, Doncaster, DN4 8QN 

Telephone: 03000 211189 
Email: rdash.foirdash@nhs.net 

 
Text only phone for deaf/hard of hearing: 07771933869 

Henry Shelford 
foi-email@adhduk.co.uk 
 
21 July 2025 
 
Dear Applicant  
 
Your Request for Information – FOI 4598 
 
Further to your request for information, please find the response below: 
 

Query Response 

This is a freedom of information request. Thank you for your time and consideration of 
this. 

(A1) Does your organisation 
commission Adult ADHD 
Assessments? If yes, please 
list: 

(A1-i) the organisation or 
organisations in receipt of 
commission from you alongside 
the contract value for the last 
public sector financial year (1st 
April 2024 – 31st March 2025) 
and the current public sector 
financial year (1st April 2025 – 
31st March 2026). 

 

RDaSH did not commission adult ADHD assessments 
in the period 1st April 2024-31st March 2025.  

 

 

RDaSH have not commissioned Adult ADHD services 
for the current financial year 2025/26 

 

 

 

 

 

 

(A2)Does your organisation 
commission Child ADHD 

Yes 

 

mailto:rdash.foirdash@nhs.net


Assessments? If yes, please 
list: 

(A2-i) the organisation or 
organisations in receipt of 
commission from you alongside 
the contract value for the last 
public sector financial year (1st 
April 2024 – 31st March 2025) 
and the current public sector 
financial year (1st April 2025 – 
31st March 2026). 

 

 

 

RDaSH commissioned a subcontractor to deliver Digital 
ADHD assessment services for the 2024/25 and 
2025/26 periods 

 

2024/25 The trust commissioned CYP ADHD digital 
assessments up to the value of £24k 

 

2025/26 The Trust has awarded to 3 suppliers contracts 
for the provision of digital Neurodevelopment 
assessments. This can include ADHD, Autism or dual 
assessments (ADHD/Autism). The Trust will commit to 
a minimum of 50 and a maximum of 500 assessments 
for the contract period.  

(A3) Does your organisation 
undertake Adult ADHD 
Assessments? If yes, please 
list: 

(A3-i) the organisation or 
organisations that have 
contracted you to provide the 
ADHD Assessment service 
alongside the financial contract 
value for the last public sector 
financial year (1st April 2024 – 
31st March 2025) and the 
current public sector financial 
year (1st April 2025 – 31st 
March 2026). 

 

Yes 

 

 

South Yorkshire Integrated Care Board (ICB) 

Humber North Yorkshire Integrated Care Board (ICB) 

Following a search of our electronic and manual records 
we do not record the financial information detailed within 
your request. We are unable to assist you on this 
occasion as the information is not held by Rotherham 
Doncaster and South Humber NHS Foundation Trust. 
FoIA S1(1) Information Not Held. Please contact South 
Yorkshire ICB https://southyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/our-
information/freedom-information-foi and Humber North 
Yorkshire ICB 
https://humberandnorthyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/foi/  

 

(A4) Does your organisation 
undertake Child ADHD 
Assessments? If yes, please 
list: 

(A4-i) the organisation or 
organisations that have 
contracted you to provide the 

Yes 

 

 

South Yorkshire Integrated Care Board (ICB) 

Humber North Yorkshire Integrated Care Board (ICB) 

https://southyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/our-information/freedom-information-foi
https://southyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/our-information/freedom-information-foi
https://humberandnorthyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/foi/


ADHD Assessment service 
alongside the financial contract 
value for the last public sector 
financial year (1st April 2024 – 
31st March 2025) and the 
current public sector financial 
year (1st April 2025 – 31st 
March 2026). 

 

Following a search of our electronic and manual records 
we do not record the financial information detailed within 
your request. We are unable to assist you on this 
occasion as the information is not held by Rotherham 
Doncaster and South Humber NHS Foundation Trust. 
FoIA S1(1) Information Not Held. Please contact South 
Yorkshire ICB https://southyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/our-
information/freedom-information-foi and Humber North 
Yorkshire ICB 
https://humberandnorthyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/foi/ 

Please could you provide the information for the last public sector year (the period 
covering 1st April 2024 – 31st March 2025). 

(B1). The number of Adult 
ADHD Assessments 
undertaken in that period 
 

763  

(B2). The number of Adults 
waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment at the end of that 
period. 
 

5069 

(B3). The number of Adults 
waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment at the date of 
receipt of this FOI request. 
 

The waiting list as at the 13th May 2025 was 4,970.  

(B4). The number of Child 
ADHD Assessments 
undertaken in that period 
 

957 

The assessments completed include those children 
who have been assessed for ADHD and dual 
assessments which include both ADHD and Autism 

(B5). The number of Children 
waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment at the end of that 
period. 
 

2482 

The number of children waiting includes those children 
are waiting for both an ADHD assessment and dual 
assessments which include both ADHD and Autism 

(B6). The number of Children 
waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment as of the date of 
receipt of this FOI request. 
 

The current waiting list as at the 13th May 2025 was 
2,572. 

The number of children waiting includes those children 
are waiting for both an ADHD assessment and dual 
assessments which include both ADHD and Autism 

If it does not take us over the FOI cost threshold, then please can we ask similar 
questions for the prior public sector year. For the period covering 1st April 2023 to 31st 
March 2024. 

https://southyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/our-information/freedom-information-foi
https://southyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/our-information/freedom-information-foi
https://humberandnorthyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/foi/


(B7). The number of Adult 
ADHD Assessments 
undertaken in that period 
 

RDaSH can provide Adult ADHD Assessments by 
calendar year only: 

 

(B8). The number of Adults 
waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment at the end of that 
period. 
 

3,830  

 

(B9). The number of Child 
ADHD Assessments 
undertaken in that period 
 

RDaSH can provide Child ADHD Assessments by 
calendar year only; 

 

(B10). The number of Children 
waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment in that period. 

 

2,110  

 

If it does not take us over the FOI cost threshold, then please can we ask the same 
questions for the public sector, the year before the above. For the period covering 1st April 
2022 to 31st March 2023 

(B11). The number of Adult 
ADHD Assessments 
undertaken in that period 
 

Please see B7 

(B12). The number of Adults 
waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment at the end of that 
period. 
 

2,034 

(B13). The number of Child 
ADHD Assessments 
undertaken in that period 
 

Please see B9 

(B14). The number of Children 
waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment in that period. 
 

1,888 - this includes all CYP waiting for a 
Neurodevelopment assessment so is for ADHD and 
Autism as at the time of reporting we were unable to 
split the Neurodevelopment pathway by ADHD, Autism 
and for those waiting for dual diagnosis 

 



If it does not take us over the FOI cost threshold, then please can we ask the same 
questions for the public sector, the year before the above. For the period covering 1st April 
2021 to 31st March 2022. 

 

(B15). The number of Adult 
ADHD Assessments 
undertaken in that period 
 

Please see B7 

(B16). The number of Adults 
waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment at the end of that 
period. 
 

948  

(B17). The number of Child 
ADHD Assessments 
undertaken in that period 
 

Please see B9 

(B18). The number of Children 
waiting for an ADHD 
Assessment in that period. 

  

 

1,872 - this includes all CYP waiting for a 
Neurodevelopment assessment so is for ADHD and 
Autism as at the time of reporting we were unable to 
split the Neurodevelopment pathway by ADHD, Autism 
and for those waiting for dual diagnosis. 

If it does not take us over the FOI cost threshold, then please can we ask this additional 
set of questions 

 

(C1). Did you pay out under 
Right to Choose for Adult 
ADHD Assessments in the prior 
public sector year? If yes: 

 

Following a search of our electronic and manual 
records we do not record the financial information 
detailed within your request. We are unable to assist 
you on this occasion as the information is not held by 
Rotherham Doncaster and South Humber NHS 
Foundation Trust. FoIA S1(1) Information Not Held. 
Please contact South Yorkshire ICB 
https://southyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/our-
information/freedom-information-foi and Humber North 
Yorkshire ICB 
https://humberandnorthyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/foi/  

(C1-i) How many Adult ADHD 
Assessments were paid out 
under Right to Choose in the 
last public sector year (20024-
25) 
 

As above 

 

https://southyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/our-information/freedom-information-foi
https://southyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/our-information/freedom-information-foi
https://humberandnorthyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk/foi/


(C1-ii) What was the total value 
of Adult ADHD Assessments 
under Right to Choose in the 
last public sector year (20024-
25). 
 

As above 

 

(C1-iii) Please list the 
organisations you paid out for 
Adult ADHD Assessments 
under Right to Choose, 
alongside the total financial 
amount paid, and the quantity 
of Adult ADHD Assessments 
undertaken for the last public 
sector year (April 1st, 2024 - 
31st March 2025). 
 

As above 

 

(C2). Did you pay out under 
Right to Choose for Child 
ADHD Assessments in the prior 
public sector year? If yes: 

 

As above 

 

(C2-i) How many Child ADHD 
Assessments were paid out 
under Right to Choose in the 
last public sector year (20024-
25) 
 

As above 

 

(C2-ii) What was the total value 
of Child ADHD Assessments 
under Right to Choose in the 
last public sector year (20024-
25). 
 

As above 

 

(C2-iii) Please list the 
organisations you paid out for 
Child ADHD Assessments 
under Right to Choose, 
alongside the total financial 
amount paid, and the quantity 
of Child ADHD Assessments 
undertaken for the last public 
sector year (April 1st, 2024 - 
31st March 2025). 
 

As above 

 

 



If you are dissatisfied with this response or with the way that your request has been handled 
and would like to request an internal review, please advise within 20 working days of the date 
of this letter quoting the FOI reference number.  Please email to rdash.foirdash@nhs.net or 
mail to the address above. 

Further information and independent advice regarding the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
and the Environmental Information Regulations 2004 is available from the Information 
Commissioner’s Office: 
 
Information Commissioner's Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
www.ico.org.uk  
 
Tel: 0303 123 1113 (local rate) or 01625 545 745 if you prefer to use a national rate number. 

Yours faithfully 

Freedom of Information 

Information Governance 

mailto:rdash.foirdash@nhs.net
http://www.ico.org.uk/

