NHS

Gloucestershire

Reference: FOI 50442 GLO QR1
Subject: ADHD Assessments

| can confirm that we have now completed the search for the information requested, please see responses below:

QUESTION RESPONSE

Section A:

1. Does your organisation commission Adult ADHD

? ist:
Assessments? If yes, please list: We currently commission GHC NHSFT to provide adult ADHD assessments. This

provision is part of a wider service and as such we cannot disaggregate the ADHD value

the organisation or organisations in receipt of from the block contract.

commission from you alongside the contract value for
the last public sector financial year (1st April 2024 —
31st March 2025) and the current public sector financial
year (1st April 2025 — 31st March 2026).

2. Does your organisation commission Child ADHD
Assessments? If yes, please list:

We currently commission GHC NHSFT to provide CYP ADHD assessments. This
provision is part of a wider service and as such we cannot disaggregate the ADHD value
from the block contract.

the organisation or organisations in receipt of
commission from you alongside the contract value for
the last public sector financial year (1st April 2024 —
31st March 2025) and the current public sector financial
year (1st April 2025 — 31st March 2026).

3. Does your organisation undertake Adult ADHD
Assessments? If yes, please list:

the organisation or organisations that have contracted
you to provide the ADHD Assessment service alongside | Not applicable: The ICB is a commissioning body not a service provider.
the financial contract value for the last public sector
financial year (1st April 2024 — 31st March 2025) and the
current public sector financial year (1st April 2025 —
31st March 2026).
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Does your organisation undertake Child ADHD
Assessments? If yes, please list:

the organisation or organisations that have contracted
you to provide the ADHD Assessment service alongside
the financial contract value for the last public sector
financial year (1st April 2024 — 31st March 2025) and the
current public sector financial year (1st April 2025 —
31st March 2026).

Not applicable: The ICB is a commissioning body not a service provider.

5.

Section B

Please could you provide the information for the last public sector year (the period covering 1st April 2024 — 31st March 2025).

a)

The number of Adult ADHD Assessments undertaken in
that period

b)

The number of Adults waiting for an ADHD Assessment
at the end of that period.

The number of Adults waiting for an ADHD Assessment
at the date of receipt of this FOI request

d)

The number of Child ADHD Assessments undertaken in
that period

e)

The number of Children waiting for an ADHD
Assessment at the end of that period.

f)

The number of Children waiting for an ADHD
Assessment as of the date of receipt of this FOI request.

| can confirm that the ICB does not hold this information. We therefore suggest you
contact the service provider, Gloucestershire Health and Care NHS Foundation Trust as
they may be able to provide the data required.
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If it does not take us over the FOI cost threshold, then please can we ask similar questions for the prior public sector year. For the period

covering 1st April 2023 to 31st March 2024.

a) The number of Adult ADHD Assessments
undertaken in that period

b) The number of Adults waiting for an ADHD
Assessment at the end of that period.

¢) The number of Child ADHD Assessments
undertaken in that period

d) The number of Children waiting for an ADHD
Assessment at the end of that period.

| can confirm that the ICB does not hold this information. We therefore suggest you
contact the service provider, Gloucestershire Health and Care NHS Foundation Trust as
they may be able to provide the data required.

If it does not take us over the FOI cost threshold, then please can we ask the same questions for the public sector, the year before the above.

For the period covering 1st April 2022 to 31st March 2023.

a) The number of Adult ADHD Assessments
undertaken in that period

b) The number of Adults waiting for an ADHD
Assessment at the end of that period.

¢) The number of Child ADHD Assessments
undertaken in that period

d) The number of Children waiting for an ADHD
Assessment at the end of that period.

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold this information. We therefore suggest you
contact the service provider, Gloucestershire Health and Care NHS Foundation Trust as
they may be able to provide the data required.
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If it does not take us over the FOI cost threshold, then please can we ask the same questions for the public sector, the year before the above.

For the period covering 1st April 2021 to 31st March 2022.

a) The number of Adult ADHD Assessments
undertaken in that period

b) The number of Adults waiting for an ADHD
Assessment at the end of that period.

¢) The number of Child ADHD Assessments
undertaken in that period

d) The number of Children waiting for an ADHD
Assessment at the end of that period.

| can confirm that the ICB does not hold this information. We therefore suggest you
contact the service provider, Gloucestershire Health and Care NHS Foundation Trust as
they may be able to provide the data required.

Section C

9.

If it does not take us over the FOI cost threshold, then please can we ask this additional set of questions

a) Did you pay out under Right to Choose for Adult ADHD

Assessments in the prior public sector year? If yes:

Yes, we comply with Right to Choose requests.

b) How many Adult ADHD Assessments were paid out

under Right to Choose in the last public sector year
(20024-25)

The ICB does not hold this information.



https://www.ghc.nhs.uk/who-we-are/freedom-of-information/

NHS

Gloucestershire
Provider £
ADHD 360 Ltd 123,518.60
Axia ASD Ltd 2,000.00
Clinical Partners Ltd 125,934.99
Evolve Psychology Services Ltd 11,280.00
Jajawi & Asker Ltd 49,860.23
Provide Wellbeing Ltd 8,125.00
Psych-Uk Ltd 714,721.78
c) Please list the organisations you paid out for Adult Teledoctor Ltd 67.500.00
ADHD Assessments under Right to Choose, alongside - :
the total financial amount paid, and the quantity of Adult | | Evolve Psychology Services Ltd 14,450.00
ADHD Assessments undertaken for the last public Provide Wellbeing Ltd 18,895.00
sector year (April 1st 2024- 31st March 2025). Solutions 4 Health Ltd 2 985.00
RTN Mental Health Solutions Ltd 10,250.00
Harrow Health CIC 3,000.00
Navigo 265.00
Your Patient Choice Ltd 5,247.00
Provide Enterprises Ltd 3,550.00
Total 1,161,582.60

ADHD Assessments undertaken — The ICB does not hold this information.

10. Did you pay out under Right to Choose for Child ADHD
Assessments in the prior public sector year? If yes:

Yes, we comply with Right to Choose requests.
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a) How many Child ADHD Assessments were paid out

under Right to Choose in the last public sector year The ICB does not hold this information.
(20024-25)
Provider
_ ADHD 360 LTD 4,739.50
b) What was the total value of Child ADHD Assessments .
i ) . Clinical Partners Ltd 2,810.00
under Right to Choose in the last public sector year .
(20024-25). Jajawi & Asker Ltd 1,177.00
Evolve Psychology Services Ltd 14,450.00
Total 23,176.50

c) Please list the organisations you paid out for Child
ADHD Assessments under Right to Choose, alongside Providers are listed in the response above.
the total financial amount paid, and the quantity of Child
ADHD Assessments undertaken for the last public ADHD Assessments undertaken — The ICB does not hold this information.
sector year (April 1st 2024- 31st March 2025).

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 19 May 2025 and has been authorised for release by Holly Beaman, Associate Director
Children and Families for NHS Gloucestershire ICB.




