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22 May 2026

Dear Requester

FOI Reference Number: 10463

We write in response to your email dated 6 May 2026 which requested information in relation
to ADHD Assessments.

The Integrated Care Board (ICB) is confirming in accordance with Section (1) (a) of the Act,
whether it holds the information requested and (b) is supplying it unless stated otherwise.

NHS Northamptonshire Integrated Care Board can confirm it does hold the information you
have requested in part. Accordingly, the ICB has provided a copy of your request below
along with its response(s) for context and ease of reference.

Question: | Response:
Adult ADHD Assessments
1. How many adults do you have waiting | This information is not held by the
for an ADHD diagnosis at the ICB. We recommend you contact the local
moment? provider serving the Northamptonshire
2. How many adults were given an population for the information you
ADHD Assessment in the last year require. Their contact details are below:
(1st April 2025 - 31st March 2026). Website: www.nhft.nhs.uk
3. If an adult was referred to you now Email: foi@nhft.nhs.uk
when would you expect them to be
seen?
4. Please describe your current Adult e Standard NHS referral via GP to
ADHD Assessment pathway. local NHS provider NHFT Adult
ADHD
e Autism & Tourette’'s Team (AAATT)
e Right to Choose via GP
e Private Assessment
5. Do you have any indicative activity Not currently.
plans in place for Right to Choose
ADHD Adult Assessment providers?
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6. If yes, to the above, please outline Not Applicable.
each indicative activity plan (for Adult
ADHD Assessment providers) that
you have in place. Including the name
of the provider and the activity plan
they are to adhere to.
Child ADHD Assessments

7. How many children do you have This information is not held by the
waiting for an ADHD diagnosis at the | ICB. We recommend you contact the local
moment? provider serving the Northamptonshire
population for the information you
8. How many children were given an require. Their contact details are below:
ADHD Assessment in the last year Website: www.nhft.nhs.uk
(1st April 2025 - 31st March 2026). Email: foi@nhft.nhs.uk

9. If a child was referred to you now
when would you expect them to be

seen?
10. Please describe your current Child Details of assessment pathways can be
ADHD Assessment pathway. found in the FAQ section of our

website: https://www.icnorthamptonshire.o
rg.uk/autism-adhd
11. Do you have any indicative activity No.
plans in place for Right to Choose
ADHD Child Assessment providers?

12. If yes, to the above, please outline Not Applicable.
each indicative activity plan (for Child
ADHD Assessment providers) that
you have in place. Including the name
of the provider and the activity plan
they are to adhere to.

| hope that this answers your queries with the information we currently hold, but if | can be of
any further assistance please do not hesitate to contact me.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for an
internal review. Internal review requests should be submitted within two months of the date of
receipt of the response to your original letter and should be addressed to:

NHS Northamptonshire Integrated Care Board
FOI team

Haylock House

Kettering Parkway

Kettering Venture Park
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If you are not content with the outcome of your internal review, you may apply directly to the
Information Commissioner for a decision. Generally, the ICO cannot make a decision unless
you have exhausted the complaints procedure provided by the ICB.

The Information Commissioner can be contacted at: telephone 0303 123 1113,
email icocasework@ico.org.uk and https://ico.org.uk/global/contact-us/

Under the terms of the Open Government Licence, you may use and re-use the information
provided within this response (not including logos or photographs), free of charge in any
format or medium; unless identified as another party’s copyright.

http://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/doc/open-government-licence/version/3/
Yours faithfully

Ajey Sharma
FOI Team
NHS Northamptonshire Integrated Care Board
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